
Pray for God’s comfort 
and miraculous pro-
vision as families try 
to survive with what 
little they have. 

Pray for leaders of im-
poverished countries 
to have the wisdom 
and resources needed 
to build systems that 
protect crops from 
floods and droughts.

Pray for caregivers 
and children suffering 
from hunger; pray for 
provision, peace and 
long-term solutions to 
the global food crisis.

Pray that God would 
provide economic 
stability to the people 
of Uganda who are 
impacted by inflation.

Pray that God would 
protect the hearts of 
those waiting for his 
provision. Pray  they 
would tangibly feel his 
comfort and presence 
in the midst of suf-
fering.

Pray for Compassion’s 
local church partners 
who are seeing the 
food crisis firsthand 
and responding to 
meet needs. Ask for 
them to have wisdom, 
endurance and re-
sources.

Pray for the war in 
the Ukraine to cease. 
Ask that global food 
supply chains will be 
restored quickly.

Pray for rains to 
come and a success-
ful harvests in areas 
affected by famines 
and drought.

Pray for the people 
of Ethiopia, who are 
facing a terrible com-
bination of political 
conflict and drought. 

Lift up the people of 
Togo, who have been 
hit by devastating 
floods, economic 
turmoil and now a 
deteriorating food 
situation.. 

Pray for expectant 
mothers who are 
facing food insecurity. 
Pray God will sustain 
them and the precious 
babies that they carry. 

Pray for the hearts 
and minds of parents 
struggling to find 
food to feed their 
families.

Pray for wisdom and 
stamina for our front-
line church partners 
as they seek resources 
to provide for the 
children and families 
in their care.

Pray for peace in war-
torn lands where there 
is food insecurity.
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Pray for caregivers 
and children in 
Burkina Faso who 
are suffering from 
hunger. Pray that God 
will provide, offering 
peace and sustainable 
solutions to their 
hunger.
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Pray that God’s peo-
ple would respond 
with compassion and 
generosity to their 
global neighbors in 
need, rallying together 
to leverage our re-
sources.

Ask God to move in 
the hearts of Chris-
tians around the 
world, giving them 
an awareness of the 
global food crisis and 
the suffering that is 
happening every day.

Pray that through the 
church’s response and 
action, more people 
would come into rela-
tionship with God.
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Ask God to move in 
the hearts of those in 
authority around the 
world. Pray that they 
would come up with 
creative solutions to 
the food crisis and 
act in unity to relieve 
suffering. 

Ask God to protect 
families from symp-
toms of stress related 
to lack of food: de-
pression, substance 
abuse, domestic 
violence, and PTSD.

Lift up the people of 
Haiti, as they deal 
with food insecurity, 
political instability 
and relentless natural 
disasters.
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Pray that God would 
prevent families from 
taking desperate mea-
sures to relieve their 
suffering, like forcing 
young girls to marry 
early or trafficking 
family members for 
money or food. 
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Pray for the people 
of Sri Lanka, who are 
experiencing wide-
spread shortages of 
milk and flour, as well 
as extremely high food 
price inflation. 

Pray that those who 
are living in comfort 
will hear the cries of 
the suffering and be 
compelled to action.  
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Pray that those who 
are especially vulner-
able — like orphans 
and widows – find 
provision and relief 
from hunger.

Pray that relief work-
ers around the world 
would be mobilized 
and able to access 
areas in need.

Ask God to protect 
children from the 
long-term cognitive 
and physical impacts 
of malnutrition 
that can keep them 
trapped in a cycle of 
poverty. 
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Pray that families 
will stay safe after 
heavy rain has caused 
flooding in Honduras, 
Indonesia, Nicaragua 
and other countries.
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Pray that God would 
protect children 
who have weakened 
immune systems as a 
result of malnutrition.

Pray for healing for 
Mario in the Domin-
ican Republic as he 
receives treatment to 
cure a kidney infec-
tion.
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Pray for Tirtho and 
Zingngakpar in 
Bangladesh as they 
prepare to have heart 
operations. Pray too 
for peace for their 
families.
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